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FIG. 1A shows a conventional output controlling
apparatus of a three-phase AC motor. The apparatus
comprises a three-phase AC motor 1 having a rotor 2

of a permanent magnet and a stator 3 of an armature,
a current detecting circuit 4 for detecting a three-

phase AC current in the three-phase AC motor, and a
frequency setting unit 5 for setting the switching

frequency of pulse-width modulated (PWM) controlled
three-phase AC voltages at the three-phase AC motor
1 so as to control the current of the three-phase AC
motor 1. In the frequency setting unit 5, a frequency
setting table 6 is constructed so that the interval of

one cycle of the input three-phase AC voltage is
divided into twenty-one steps of 0.2 to 20 Hz. The

current detecting circuit 4 is designed to operate in
two periods, which are in the second and fourth
periods of one cycle of the input three-phase AC

voltage, respectively. When the current detecting
circuit 4 operates in the second period, the PWM
controlled voltage is determined according to the

voltage of the three-phase AC motor 1 detected at that
time. When the current detecting circuit 4 operates in

the fourth period, the PWM controlled voltage is
determined according to the voltage of the three-

phase AC motor 1 detected at that time. The output
controlling apparatus operates as follows. The current

of the three-phase AC motor 1 is detected by the
current detecting circuit 4, the PWM controlled voltage
at each phase is determined according to the output of
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the current detecting circuit 4, and the phase voltage
of the three-phase AC motor 1 is input to the three-

phase AC motor 1 in the PWM controlled voltage. The
output of the three-phase AC motor 1 is detected by

the current detecting circuit 4 in the second and fourth
periods of the one cycle of the input three-phase AC

voltage and the detected output is stored in
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